
COMMUNITY BUDGETING PHASE 2  

COMMUNITY BUDGETING PHASE 2 RESULTS 

Your Dumbarton East & Central 

Name of 
project 

Summary of bid Votes 
cast 
online 

Votes 
cast at 
event 

Total 
votes 

Funding 
Allocated  

Benview 
Resource 
Centre 

Our project is “The Outside 
View”, to look at additional 
activities with young people 
in the outdoor environment. 
Also working with older 
people from the lunch club 
and befriending service 
bringing generations 
together. 

188 30 218 £2,230 

Castlegreen 
allotments 

Purchase motorised 
wheelbarrow and shipping 
container to transport 
compost and topsoil to 
community allotments. 

121 17 138 £3,753 

Dumbarton 
Riverside 
Church social 

Buy suitable scaffolding for 
use around the building for 
repairs and use of local 
community and surrounding 
areas 

45 33 78 £3,000 

Dumbarton 
Young 
firefighters 

Purchase gazebo, tent & 
BBQ for events for young 
people and wider community 
to attend also. 

46 37 83 £800 

Gaelic group To purchase laptop, 
computer equipment enabling 
ICT/Internet for delivery of 
language and music classes 
within the Concord. 

0 27 27 £795 

Riverside 
Church 

Purchase and install water 
boiler for tea and coffees for 
groups using the facilities. 

35 17 52 £1,234 

West 
Dunbartonshire 
Community 
Foodshare 

Dumbarton – Cooking 
equipment, utensils, growing 
& gardening tools for project 
to equip people with skills to 
cook and grow food on a 
limited budget. 

23 25 48 £2,122 

 

COMMUNITY BUDGETING PHASE 2 RESULTS 

Your Dumbarton West 

Name of 
project 

Summary of bid Votes 
cast 

Votes 
at 

Total 
votes 

Funding 
allocated  



online event 

Brucehill 
Nursery & 
Family 
Association 

Implementation of a new play 
area at Brucehill Nursery to 
replace the existing play area 
which is no longer fit for 
purpose. This includes a 
variety of outdoor durable 
equipment for use in the 
nursery. 

167 62 229 £10,000 

Dumbarton area 
council on 
alcohol 

Renovate and upgrade 
kitchen, reception and social 
areas in Westbridgend 
premises. This includes 
purchase of new kitchen 
equipment, replacing seating 
and tables area used by 
clients on a daily basis drop-
in sessions, reception and 
Breakfast & Lunch Club. 

60 47 107 £3,479 

Friends of 
Levengrove 
Park 

IT equipment for group 8 33 41 £500 

Dalreoch parent 
council 

Outdoor education project in 
school: gardening club, 
science, playground and 
upgrades to benefit all 
children in school and local 
community. 

95 45 140 £10,000 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  


